
 

S.R. 2011/16 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

SAMOA 

 

CUSTOMS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 2011 
 

Arrangement of Provisions 

 

1. Short title and 

commencement 

2. Licence fee 

3. Increased rates for certain 

customs fees 

__________ 
 

 

PURSUANT to section 279 of the Customs Act 1977,                            

I, TUI ATUA TUPUA TAMASESE EFI, Head of State,              

MAKE the following regulations: 

 

 
DATED this 9

th 
day of August 2011. 

 

 
 

          signed:     (Tui Atua Tupua Tamasese Efi) 

                                    HEAD OF STATE 

 
REGULATIONS 

 

1. Short title and commencement-(1) These regulations 

may be cited as the Customs Amendment Regulations 2011 and 

shall be read together with and form part of the Customs 

Regulations 1986 (“Principal Regulations”) and the Customs 

Amendment Regulations 1998, as relevant. 



 

4                 Customs Amendment Regulations                 2011/16 

 

(2) These regulations commence on 1 July 2011.  

 

2. Licence fee - In regulation 87 of the Principal 

Regulations, for “$500” substitute “$670”. 

 

3. Increased rates for certain customs fees - In the 

Schedule to the Customs Amendment Regulations 1998: 

(a) in respect of the fee payable for an application for 

bonded areas, for “$500” substitute “$670”; and 

(b) in relation to the fee payable for an application for a 

deferred duty, for “$25 per application” 

substitute “$35 per application”. 

 

_________ 

 
Issued under the authority of the Regulations Ordinance 1953. 

Date of Commencement:  1 July 2011 

These Regulations are administered by the Ministry for Revenue. 
 

 

 

 

Copies of these Regulations can be purchased from  

the Office of the Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 
 

 

 

 

 

Printed by the Clerk of the Legislative Assembly, 

by authority of the Legislative Assembly. 


